
General Info

Total:
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Number

24-07-C

Deadline

07/11/2024 02:00 PM PDT

Vendor

CAL VALLEY
CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Submitted

07/11/2024 01:53 PM PDT

Signed by

TONY STORELLI
Account Holder Tony
Storelli

Opened

07/11/2024 02:08 PM PDT
By
jgeddert@fresnocountyca.gov

Description

East Reedley Bridge Replacements

The work to be done consists, in general, of removing and replacing three structurally
deficient bridges: the Reedley Main Canal Bridge on Englehart Avenue, 0.04 miles north of
American Avenue; the Travers Creek Bridge on Lincoln Avenue, 0.55 miles east of Alta
Avenue; and the Travers Creek Bridge on Parlier Avenue, 0.52 miles west of Alta Avenue.
Full street closure will be required for the construction of each of the three bridges, and a
detour will be provided. In channel work will commence after the Alta Irrigation District’s
irrigation season in August or September of 2024.

Some work may commence outside of the channel prior to the end of the irrigation season.
The three bridges will be bid under a single construction contract; however, the
commencement of work may vary slightly at each location.

The Reedley Main Canal Bridge on Englehart Avenue will be replaced by a bridge with a
width of 35 feet and a length of 37 feet. The existing bridge structure will be replaced with
a two-span cast-in-place concrete box culvert. The work also consists of installing concrete
bridge barriers, reconstructing the bridge approaches and adding shoulders, cold planing
and overlaying existing pavement, constructing driveways, installing crash cushions, and in-
channel work. Two orange trees will be removed.

The Travers Creek Bridge on Lincoln Avenue will be replaced by a bridge with a width of
63 feet and a length of 24 feet. The existing bridge structure will be replaced with a cast-in-
place bottomless concrete box culvert with a foundation of concrete footings. The work
also consists of installing concrete bridge barriers, reconstructing bridge approaches and
adding shoulders, cold planing and overlaying existing pavement, constructing driveways,
installing drainage pipe between the channel and ditch, and installing rock slope protection
in the channel. One stump will be removed.

The Travers Creek Bridge on Parlier Avenue will be replaced by a bridge with a width of
49 feet and a length of 29 feet. The existing bridge structure will be replaced with a two-
span cast-in-place concrete box culvert. The work also consists of installing concrete
bridge barriers, reconstructing bridge approaches and adding shoulders, constructing
driveways, installing crash cushions, and installing concrete slope protection and rock
slope protection in the channel. Approximately eleven trees will be removed.

The DBE Contract Goal is 22 percent.

Reedley Main Canal Bridge Replacement on Englehart Avenue:
Federal Project Number BRLO-5942(239)
Travers Creek Bridge Replacement on Lincoln Avenue:
Federal Project Number BRLO-5942(226)
Travers Creek Bridge Replacement on Parlier Avenue:
Federal Project Number BRLO-5942(227)

Allows zero unit prices and labor

Yes

Allows negative unit prices and labor

Yes

Attachment List

Project Website
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RFC form, bid opening details, any Supplemental Information
including RFC responses, prebid conference information, etc.

Specifications (19 MB)
Specifications (19 MB)

Plans (21 MB)
Plans (21 MB)

Addendum 1 (http://www.fresnocountyca.gov/files/sharedassets/county/v/1/public-works-and-planning/design/construction-bidding-opportunities/24-07-c-

east-reedley-bridge-replacements/addendum-1.pdf)

Addendum 1

Proposal to the County of Fresno - Proposal 1

Proposal to the County of Fresno

hereinafter called the Owner

EAST REEDLEY BRIDGE REPLACEMENTS

REEDLEY MAIN CANAL BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ON ENGLEHART AVENUE: BRLO-5942(239)
TRAVERS CREEK BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ON LINCOLN AVENUE: BRLO-5942(226)
TRAVERS CREEK BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ON PARLIER AVENUE: BRLO-5942(227)

The work embraced herein shall be done in accordance with the 2015 Standard Specifications and with the 2015 Standard Plans,
of the State of California, Department of Transportation insofar as the same may apply and in accordance with these special
provisions.

Except to the extent that they may conflict with these special provisions, revised Standard Specifications apply to the extent
included in the section entitled “Project Details” of the book entitled “Specifications."

The work to be done is shown on a set of Plans, Department File No. 11309, 11245, and 11246, entitled: “East Reedley Bridge
Replacements”.

The undersigned, as bidder, declares that the only persons, or parties interested in this proposal as principals are those named
herein, that this proposal is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation; that they have carefully examined
the location of the proposed work, the annexed proposed form of contract, and the plans therein referred to; and they propose
and agree if this proposal is accepted, that they will contract with the Owner to provide all necessary machinery, tools, apparatus
and other means of construction, and to do all the work and furnish all the materials specified in the contract in the manner and
time therein prescribed, and according to the requirements of the Engineer as therein set forth, and that they will take in full
payment therefor the following unit prices, to-wit:

Reedley Main Canal
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$922,754.00

Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

1 2 EA Construction Project Funding Signs $1,650.00 $3,300.00

2 1 LS Builder's All-Risk Insurance $5,000.00 $5,000.00

3 1 LS Federal Trainee Program $1,200.00 $1,200.00

4 1,000 $ AID Inspection Fee $1.00 $1,000.00

5 1 LS Bird Exclusion Plan $750.00 $750.00

6 1 LS Install and Maintain Bird Exclusion Devices $2,500.00 $2,500.00

7 1 LS Lead Compliance Plan $1,000.00 $1,000.00

8 1 LS Traffic Control System $80,000.00 $80,000.00

9 80 LF Temporary Railing (Type K) $42.00 $3,360.00

10 1 LS Job Site Management $1,000.00 $1,000.00

11 1 LS Prepare and Implement WPCP $550.00 $550.00

12 260 LF Temporary High-Visibility Fencing $14.00 $3,640.00

13 475 LF Remove Yellow Painted Traffic Strip (Hazardous Waste) $25.00 $11,875.00

14 110 LF Remove Fence $10.00 $1,100.00

15 2 EA Remove Roadside Sign $140.00 $280.00

16 1 EA Relocate Roadside Sign $275.00 $275.00

17 1 LS Clearing and Grubbing $25,000.00 $25,000.00

18 2 EA Tree Removal $1,300.00 $2,600.00

19 320 CY Roadway Excavation - Final Pay Item $64.00 $20,480.00

20 1 LS Finishing Roadway $6,000.00 $6,000.00

21 250 CY Aggregate Base (Class II) - Final Pay Item $100.00 $25,000.00

22 430 TON Hot Mix Asphalt (Type A) $150.00 $64,500.00

Total: $922,754.00
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Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

23 12 TON Minor Hot Mix Asphalt $300.00 $3,600.00

24 150 SQYD Cold Plane Asphalt Concrete Pavement $11.00 $1,650.00

25 8 CY Minor Concrete $2,200.00 $17,600.00

26 2 EA Roadside Sign - One Post $315.00 $630.00

27 20 EA Pavement Marker (Retroreflective) $16.00 $320.00

28 2 EA Crash Cushion (TAU-M) $30,000.00 $60,000.00

29 880 LF 4" White Thermoplastic Traffic Striping (Detail 27B) $12.00 $10,560.00

30 570 LF 4" Yellow Thermoplastic Traffic Striping (Detail 5,22) $16.00 $9,120.00

31 19 SQFT Thermoplastic Pavement Marking $20.00 $380.00

32 170 CY Structure Excavation (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $500.00 $85,000.00

33 135 CY Structure Backfill (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $300.00 $40,500.00

34 115 CY Structural Concrete, Culvert - Final Pay Item $1,250.00 $143,750.00

35 30 CY Structural Concrete, Retaining Wall - Final Pay Item $2,500.00 $75,000.00

36 29,500 LB Bar Reinforcing Steel (Culvert) - Final Pay Item $1.50 $44,250.00

37 6,500 LB Bar Reinforcing Steel (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $1.50 $9,750.00

38 1 LS Bridge Removal - Final Pay Item $19,000.00 $19,000.00

39 122 LF Concrete Barrier (Type 836) - Final Pay Item $297.00 $36,234.00

40 1 LS Mobilization $105,000.00 $105,000.00

Total: $922,754.00

Travers Creek on Lincoln

$1,471,027.00

Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

Total: $1,471,027.00
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Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

41 2 EA Construction Project Funding Signs $1,650.00 $3,300.00

42 1 LS Builder's All-Risk Insurance $5,000.00 $5,000.00

43 1 LS Federal Trainee Program $1,200.00 $1,200.00

44 1 LS Prepare Temporary Water Diversion Plan $1,000.00 $1,000.00

45 1 LS Temporary Water Diversion System $50,000.00 $50,000.00

46 1,000 $ AID Inspection Fee $1.00 $1,000.00

47 1 LS Bird Exclusion Plan $750.00 $750.00

48 1 LS Install and Maintain Bird Exclusion Devices $2,500.00 $2,500.00

49 5,830 SQFT Permanent Hydroseeding - Final Pay Item $2.00 $11,660.00

50 1,360 SQFT Rolled Erosion Control Product (Netting) $2.00 $2,720.00

51 12 EA Permanent Erosion Control Establishment Inspection $1,100.00 $13,200.00

52 1 EA Survey Monument Well $2,000.00 $2,000.00

53 1 LS Lead Compliance Plan $500.00 $500.00

54 1 LS Traffic Control System $75,000.00 $75,000.00

55 80 LF Temporary Railing (Type K) $42.00 $3,360.00

56 1 LS Job Site Management $1,000.00 $1,000.00

57 1 LS Prepare and Implement WPCP $500.00 $500.00

58 720 LF Temporary High-Visibility Fencing $12.00 $8,640.00

59 4 EA Remove Roadside Sign $140.00 $560.00

60 1 EA Reset Roadside Sign $210.00 $210.00

61 1 LS Clearing and Grubbing $22,000.00 $22,000.00

62 1 EA Tree Removal $1,300.00 $1,300.00

63 1,000 CY Roadway Excavation - Final Pay Item $25.00 $25,000.00

Total: $1,471,027.00
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Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

64 1 LS Finishing Roadway $5,500.00 $5,500.00

65 210 CY Aggregate Base (Class II) - Final Pay Item $110.00 $23,100.00

66 380 TON Hot Mix Asphalt (Type A) $150.00 $57,000.00

67 70 TON Minor Hot Mix Asphalt $160.00 $11,200.00

68 680 SQYD Cold Plane Asphalt Concrete Pavement $11.00 $7,480.00

69 3 CY Minor Concrete $1,750.00 $5,250.00

70 32 LF 18" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $225.00 $7,200.00

71 570 CY Rock Slope Protection (150lb, Class III, Method B) $400.00 $228,000.00

72 185 SQYD Rock Slope Protection Fabric (Class 8) $6.00 $1,110.00

73 50 EA Pavement Marker (Retroreflective) $16.00 $800.00

74 1,145 LF 4" White Thermoplastic Traffic Striping (Detail 27B) $12.00 $13,740.00

75 573 LF 4" Yellow Thermoplastic Traffic Striping (Detail 5,22) $16.00 $9,168.00

76 285 CY Structure Excavation (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $400.00 $114,000.00

77 235 CY Structure Backfill (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $300.00 $70,500.00

78 205 CY Structural Concrete, Culvert - Final Pay Item $1,475.00 $302,375.00

79 74 CY Structural Concrete, Footing - Final Pay Item $850.00 $62,900.00

80 50 CY Structural Concrete, Retaining Wall - Final Pay Item $1,900.00 $95,000.00

81 41,500 LB Bar Reinforcing Steel (Culvert) - Final Pay Item $1.70 $70,550.00

82 11,300 LB Bar Reinforcing Steel (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $1.70 $19,210.00

83 1 LS Bridge Removal - Final Pay Item $8,310.00 $8,310.00

84 122 LF Concrete Barrier (Type 836) - Final Pay Item $297.00 $36,234.00

85 1 LS Mobilization $90,000.00 $90,000.00

Total: $1,471,027.00
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Travers Creek on Parlier

$1,124,576.00

Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

86 2 EA Construction Project Funding Signs $1,650.00 $3,300.00

87 1 LS Builder's All-Risk Insurance $5,000.00 $5,000.00

88 1 LS Federal Trainee Program $1,200.00 $1,200.00

89 1 LS Prepare Temporary Water Diversion Plan $1,000.00 $1,000.00

90 1 LS Temporary Water Diversion System $50,000.00 $50,000.00

91 1,000 $ AID Inspection Fee $1.00 $1,000.00

92 1 LS Bird Exclusion Plan $750.00 $750.00

93 1 LS Install and Maintain Bird Exclusion Devices $2,500.00 $2,500.00

94 3,220 SQFT Permanent Hydroseeding - Final Pay Item $2.00 $6,440.00

95 1,450 SQFT Rolled Erosion Control Product (Netting) $2.00 $2,900.00

96 12 EA Permanent Erosion Control Establishment Inspection $1,100.00 $13,200.00

97 1 LS Lead Compliance Plan $1,000.00 $1,000.00

98 1 LS Traffic Control System $55,000.00 $55,000.00

99 80 LF Temporary Railing (Type K) $42.00 $3,360.00

100 1 LS Job Site Management $1,000.00 $1,000.00

101 1 LS Prepare and Implement WPCP $500.00 $500.00

102 430 LF Temporary High-Visibility Fencing $12.00 $5,160.00

103 175 LF Remove Yellow Painted Traffic Strip (Hazardous Waste) $25.00 $4,375.00

104 60 LF Relocate Fence $48.00 $2,880.00

105 1 EA Relocate Gate $1,200.00 $1,200.00

106 1 EA Remove Roadside Sign $140.00 $140.00

Total: $1,124,576.00
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Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

107 1 LS Clearing and Grubbing $27,000.00 $27,000.00

108 11 EA Tree Removal $550.00 $6,050.00

109 280 CY Roadway Excavation - Final Pay Item $69.00 $19,320.00

110 1 LS Finishing Roadway $5,000.00 $5,000.00

111 178 CY Aggregate Base (Class II) - Final Pay Item $124.00 $22,072.00

112 310 TON Hot Mix Asphalt (Type A) $150.00 $46,500.00

113 22 TON Minor Hot Mix Asphalt $240.00 $5,280.00

114 10 SQYD Cold Plane Asphalt Concrete Pavement $150.00 $1,500.00

115 1 LS Structural Concrete (Concrete Channel Lining) $50,000.00 $50,000.00

116 6 CY Minor Concrete $2,000.00 $12,000.00

117 400 LB Bar Reinforcing Steel $2.53 $1,012.00

118 1 LS Safety Access Ladder $2,500.00 $2,500.00

119 1 EA Roadside Sign - One Post $315.00 $315.00

120 40 CY Rock Slope Protection (300lb, Class IV, Method B) $600.00 $24,000.00

121 150 SQYD Rock Slope Protection Fabric (Class 8) $6.00 $900.00

122 15 LF Fence $82.00 $1,230.00

123 1 EA Gate $7,800.00 $7,800.00

124 18 EA Pavement Marker (Retroreflective) $16.00 $288.00

125 1 EA Crash Cushion (TAU-M) $41,000.00 $41,000.00

126 300 LF 4" White Thermoplastic Traffic Striping (Detail 27B) $12.00 $3,600.00

127 175 LF 4" Yellow Thermoplastic Traffic Striping (Detail 22) $16.00 $2,800.00

128 255 CY Structure Excavation (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $400.00 $102,000.00

129 215 CY Structure Backfill (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $300.00 $64,500.00

Total: $1,124,576.00
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Item No. Quantity Unit Item Description Item Price Extension

130 150 CY Structural Concrete, Culvert - Final Pay Item $1,250.00 $187,500.00

131 40 CY Structural Concrete, Retaining Wall - Final Pay Item $2,500.00 $100,000.00

132 42,300 LB Bar Reinforcing Steel (Culvert) - Final Pay Item $1.40 $59,220.00

133 8,900 LB Bar Reinforcing Steel (Retaining Wall) - Final Pay Item $1.80 $16,020.00

134 1 LS Bridge Removal - Final Pay Item $25,000.00 $25,000.00

135 112 LF Concrete Barrier (Type 836) - Final Pay Item $297.00 $33,264.00

136 1 LS Mobilization $95,000.00 $95,000.00

Total: $1,124,576.00

Evaluation of Bid Item List - Proposal 3

Abbreviations used in the bid proposal sheet are identified in Section 1-1.06, “Abbreviations,” of these special provisions.

Bids are required for the entire work. Bids will be compared on the basis indicated in the Notice to Bidders. The bidder shall set
forth for each unit basis item of work a unit price and a total for the item, and for each lump sum item a total for the item, all in
clearly legible figures in the respective spaces provided for that purpose. In the case of unit basis items, the amount set forth
under the "Item Total" column shall be the product of the unit price bid and the estimated quantity for the item.

In case of discrepancy between the unit price and the total set forth for a unit basis item, the unit price shall prevail, except as
provided in (a) or (b), as follows:

(a) If the amount set forth as a unit price is unreadable or otherwise unclear, or is omitted, or is the same as the amount as
the entry in the item total column, then the amount set forth in the item total column for the item shall prevail and shall be
divided by the estimated quantity for the item and the price thus obtained shall be the unit price;

(b) (Decimal Errors) If the product of the entered unit price and the estimated quantity is exactly off by a factor of ten, one
hundred, etc., or one-tenth, or one-hundredth, etc. from the entered total, the discrepancy will be resolved by using the
entered unit price or item total, whichever most closely approximates percentage-wise the unit price or item total in the
Owner's Final Estimate of cost.

If both the unit price and the item total are unreadable or otherwise unclear, or are omitted, the bid may be deemed irregular.
Likewise, if the item total for a lump sum item is unreadable or otherwise unclear, or is omitted, the bid may be deemed irregular
unless the project being bid has only a single item and a clear, readable total bid is provided.

Symbols such as commas and dollar signs will be ignored and have no mathematical significance in establishing any unit price or
item total or lump sums. Written unit prices, item totals and lump sums will be interpreted according to the number of digits and, if
applicable, decimal placement. Cents symbols also have no significance in establishing any unit price or item total since all
figures are assumed to be expressed in dollars and/or decimal fractions of a dollar. Bids on lump sum items shall be item totals
only; if any unit price for a lump sum item is included in a bid and it differs from the item total, the items total shall prevail.

The foregoing provisions for the resolution of specific irregularities cannot be so comprehensive as to cover every omission,
inconsistency, error or other irregularity which may occur in a bid. Any situation not specifically provided for will be determined in
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the discretion of the Owner, and that discretion will be exercised in the manner deemed by the Owner to best protect the public
interest in the prompt and economical completion of the work. The decision of the Owner respecting the amount of a bid, or the
existence or treatment of an irregularity in a bid, shall be final.
If this proposal shall be accepted and the undersigned shall fail to contract, as aforesaid, and to give the two bonds in the sums
to be determined as aforesaid, with surety satisfactory to the Owner, within eight (8) days not including Saturdays, Sundays and
legal holidays, after the bidder has received notice of award of the contract, the Owner, at its option, may determine that the
bidder has abandoned the contract, and thereupon this proposal and the acceptance thereof shall be null and void, and the
forfeiture of such security accompanying this proposal shall operate and the same shall be the property of the Owner.

Bid Security - Proposal 4

Bond Percentage

10.00%

Guarantee Method *

Electronic Bid Bond

You must either attach an electronic bid bond here or provide an original bid bond (or other form of bid security authorized by

Public Contract Code Section 20129(a)) to the office location according to the instructions in the Notice to Bidders prior to the bid

opening.

Electronic Bid Bond

Bond ID *

4BF3-4706-81D0-CF52

Surety Agency *

Tinubu Surety (formerly
SurePath)

Verify Bid Bond *

Bid bond verification has
been completed.

Surety State *

DE

Principal *

CAL VALLEY
CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Addendum Acknowledgement - Proposal 4

Bidders must acknowledge all addenda. The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following ADDENDA:

(Enter the number the Designer has assigned to each of the addenda that the Bidder is acknowledging)
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Type N/A if no addenda were issued. Click "+" to add additional fields.

Addendum No. *

1

Dated *

7/2/2024

Bidder Signature - Proposal 4

Business Name *

CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.

Note: If bidder or other interested person is a corporation, state legal name of corporation. If bidder is a co-partnership, state true
name of firm.

Type of Business *

Corporation - list Officers

Business Owners and Officers Names *

MICHELLE AVILA; PRESIDENT & TREASURER
JOHN AVILA; VICE PRESIDENT
TONY STORELLI; CHIEF OPERATING OFFICER
BRANDEN BREUCKNER; SECRETARY

Note: If bidder or other interested person is:

• a corporation, list names of the president, secretary, treasurer and manager thereof

• a partnership, list names of all individual co-partners composing firm.

• an individual, state first and last name in full.

Names of Owners and Key Employees *

MICHELLE AVILA; PRESIDENT & TREASURER
JOHN AVILA; VICE PRESIDENT
TONY STORELLI; CHIEF OPERATING OFFICER
BRANDEN BREUCKNER; SECRETARY
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Note: List majority owners of your firm. If multiple owners, list all. Also include anyone, including key employees, who are actively

promoting the contract. (SB1439)

Licensed in accordance with an act providing for the registration of Contractors:

Class *

A

Contractor License No. *

873800

Expires *

3/31/2026

DIR Registration Number *

1000009471

Business Address *

5125 N GATES AVENUE #102, FRESNO, CA

Zip Code *

93722

Mailing Address *

5125 N GATES AVENUE #102, FRESNO, CA

Zip Code *

93722

Business Phone *

(559) 274-0300

Fax Number

(559) 274-0311

E-mail Address *

estimating@calvalleyconstruction.com

Signature of Bidder *

Tony Storelli

NOTE: If bidder is a corporation, the legal name of the corporation shall be set forth above together with the signature of the
officer or officers authorized to sign contracts on behalf of the corporation; if bidder is a co-partnership, the true name of the firm
shall be set forth above together with the signature of the partner or partners authorized to sign contracts on behalf of the co-
partnership; and if bidder is an individual, bidder signature shall be placed above. If signature is by an agent, other than an officer
of a corporation or a member of a partnership, a Power of Attorney must be on file with the Owner prior to opening bids or
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submitted with the bid; otherwise, the bid will be disregarded as irregular and unauthorized.

Noncollusion Declaration - Proposal 5

Federal Project Number:

REEDLEY MAIN CANAL BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ON ENGLEHART AVENUE: BRLO-5942(239)
TRAVERS CREEK BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ON LINCOLN AVENUE: BRLO-5942(226)
TRAVERS CREEK BRIDGE REPLACEMENT ON PARLIER AVENUE: BRLO-5942(227)

To the County of Fresno:

Noncollusion Declaration

TO BE EXECUTED BY BIDDER AND SUBMITTED WITH BID*

The undersigned declares:

I am the (Choose one of the following options): *

Corporate Officer

If Corporate Officer please list Title:

CHIEF OPERATING OFFICER

of (Business Name): *

CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.

the party making the foregoing bid.

The bid is not made in the interest of, or on behalf of, any undisclosed person, partnership, company, association, organization,
or corporation. The bid is genuine and not collusive or sham. The bidder has not directly or indirectly induced or solicited any
other bidder to put in a false or sham bid. The bidder has not directly or indirectly colluded, conspired, connived, or agreed with
any bidder or anyone else to put in a sham bid, or refrain from bidding. The bidder has not in any manner, directly or indirectly,
sought by agreement, communication, or conference with anyone to fix the bid price of the bidder or any other bidder, or to fix
any overhead, profit, or cost element of the bid price, or of that of any other bidder. All statements contained in the bid are true.
The bidder has not, directly or indirectly, submitted his or her bid price or any breakdown thereof, or the contents thereof, or
divulged information or data relative thereto, to any corporation, partnership, company, association, organization, bid depository,
or to any member or agent thereof, and has not paid, and will not pay, any person or entity for that purpose.

Any person executing this declaration on behalf of a bidder that is a corporation, partnership, joint venture, limited liability
company, limited liability partnership, or any other entity, hereby represents that he or she has full power to execute, and does
execute, this declaration on behalf of the bidder.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing is true and correct and that this
declaration is executed on _________, 2024,
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Date: *

7/11/2024

at City, State: *

FRESNO, CA

Signature: *

TONY STORELLI

(See Title 23 United States Code Section 112; Calif Public Contract Code Section 7106)

*NOTE: Completing, signing, and returning the Non-Collusion Declaration is a required part of the Proposal. Bidders are cautioned
that making a false certification may subject the certifier to criminal prosecution.

Public Contract Code - Proposal 6-7

Public Contract Code Section 10285.1 Statement - Proposal 6

In conformance with Public Contract Code Section 10285.1 (Chapter 376, Stats. 1985), the bidder hereby declares under penalty
of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the bidder

Choose an option: *

Has not been convicted

within the preceding three years of any offenses referred to in that section, including any charge of fraud, bribery, collusion,
conspiracy, or any other act in violation of any state or Federal antitrust law in connection with the bidding upon, award of, or
performance of, any public works contract, as defined in Public Contract Code Section 1101, with any public entity, as defined in
Public Contract Code Section 1100, including the Regents of the University of California or the Trustees of the California State
University. The term "bidder" is understood to include any partner, member, officer, director, responsible managing officer, or
responsible managing employee thereof, as referred to in Section 10285.1.

The above Statement is part of the Bid. Signing this Bid on the signature portion thereof shall also constitute signature of this
Statement. Bidders are cautioned that making a false certification may subject the certifier to criminal prosecution.

Public Contract Code Section 10162 Questionnaire - Proposal 7
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In conformance with Public Contract Code Section 10162, the Bidder shall complete, under penalty of perjury, the following
questionnaire:

Has the bidder, any officer of the bidder, or any employee of the bidder who has a proprietary interest in the bidder, ever been
disqualified, removed, or otherwise prevented from bidding on, or completing a federal, state, or local government project because
of a violation of law or a safety regulation?

Choose an option: *

No

If the answer is No, please type N/A. If the answer is Yes, explain the circumstances in the following space. *

N/A

Public Contract Code Section 10232 Statement - Proposal 7

In conformance with Public Contract Code Section 10232, the Contractor hereby states under penalty of perjury, that no more
than one final unappealable finding of contempt of court by a federal court has been issued against the Contractor within the
immediately preceding two-years period because of the Contractor's failure to comply with an order of the National Labor
Relations Board.

Note: The above Statement and Questionnaire are part of the Bid. Signing this Bid on the signature portion thereof shall also
constitute signature of this Statement and Questionnaire. Bidders are cautioned that making a false certification may subject the
certifier to criminal prosecution.

Subcontractors - Proposal 8(a)

The following named subcontractor(s) will perform with labor, or otherwise render services to the general contractor in or about
the construction of the work or improvement in an amount in excess of one-half of one percent of the total bid presented
herewith or $10,000, whichever is greater. Each listed subcontractor's name, location of business and description of work, and
both their contractor’s license number and public works contractor registration number, issued pursuant to Section 1725.5 of the
Labor Code, are REQUIRED, by Section 4104 of the California Public Contract Code, to be submitted prior to bid opening. (The
“location of business” must specify the city in which the subcontractor’s business is located, and the state if other than
California.) All other requested information shall be submitted, either with the bid or within 24 hours after bid opening.

Please fill out as completely as possible when submitting your bid. Use subcontractor's business name style as registered with
the License Board.

FAILURE TO LIST SUBCONTRACTORS AS DIRECTED MAY RENDER THE BID NON-RESPONSIVE, OR MAY RESULT IN
ASSESSMENT OF A PENALTY AGAINST THE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 4110 OF THE CALIFORNIA
PUBLIC CONTRACT CODE.
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Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields.

Subcontractor: *

AWP SAFETY

Business Address *

3049 S. GOLDEN ST FRONTAGE RD., FRESNO, CA 93725

Class

A

License No. *

975518

DIR Registration No. *

1000001109

Item No. or Description of Work *

1, 15, 16, 26, 41, 59, 60, 86, 106, 119

Dollar Amount:

$12,310.00

OR Percentage of Total Bid:

Email Address:

DOUG.PERKINS@AWPSAFETY.COM

Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields. 1

Subcontractor: *

ABSL CONSTRUCTION

Business Address *

29393 PACIFIC ST., HAYWARD, CA 94544

Class

A

License No. *

621781
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DIR Registration No. *

1000002818

Item No. or Description of Work *

ROADWAY EXCAVATION & COLD PLANE AC PAVEMENT

Dollar Amount:

$16,200.00

OR Percentage of Total Bid:

Email Address:

DOUG@ABSLCONSTRUCTION.COM

Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields. 2

Subcontractor: *

SPECIALIZED PAVEMENT MARKING

Business Address *

6868 AVENUE 305, GOSHEN, CA 93227

Class

C32

License No. *

854894

DIR Registration No. *

1000886659

Item No. or Description of Work *

7,13,27,29,30,31,73,74,75,97,103,124,126,127

Dollar Amount:

$69,026.00

OR Percentage of Total Bid:

Email Address:

KYLE.TYLER@SPMNW.COM
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Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields. 3

Subcontractor: *

MIDSTATE BARRIER, INC.

Business Address *

PO BOX 30550 STOCKTON, CA 95213

Class

A

License No. *

529261

DIR Registration No. *

1000000538

Item No. or Description of Work *

28,39,84,125,135

Dollar Amount:

$211,632.00

OR Percentage of Total Bid:

Email Address:

MCRUMP@MIDSTATEBARRIER.COM

Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields. 4

Subcontractor: *

KROEKER, INC.

Business Address *

4627 S. CHESTNUT AVE., FRESNO, CA 93725

Class

A

License No. *

621866
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DIR Registration No. *

1000006246

Item No. or Description of Work *

38,83,134

Dollar Amount:

$47,095.00

OR Percentage of Total Bid:

Email Address:

LOUIET@KROEKERINC.COM

Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields. 5

Subcontractor: *

CHAPCO CONSTRUCTION, LLC.

Business Address *

9125 YOUNT CT., ELK GROVE, CA 95264

Class

A

License No. *

1122875

DIR Registration No. *

2000001412

Item No. or Description of Work *

5,6,34,35,36,37,44,45,47,48,78,79,80,81,82,89,90,92,93,115,117,118,130,131,132,133

Dollar Amount:

$1,534,875.00

OR Percentage of Total Bid:

Email Address:

RICH@CHAPCOCONSTRUCTION.COM
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Subcontractors - Proposal 8(b)

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields.

Subcontractor: *

No bid

Business Address *

No bid

Class

No bid

License No. *

No bid
DIR Registration No. *

No bid

Item No. or Description of Work *

No bid

Dollar Amount:

No bid

OR Percentage of Total Bid:

No bid

Email Address:

No bid

Certification With Regard To The Performance Of Previous Contracts Or Subcontracts
Subject To The Equal Opportunity Clause And The Filing Of Required Reports - Proposal 9

The bidder or proposed subcontractor hereby certifies that they

Please choose an option below *

have participated
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in a previous contract or subcontract subject to the equal opportunity clause, as required by Executive Orders 10925, 11114, or
11246, and that they

Please select an option below *

have filed

with the Joint Reporting Committee, the Director of the Office of Federal Contract Compliance, a Federal Government contracting
or administering agency, or the former President's Committee on Equal Employment Opportunity, all reports due under the
applicable filing requirements.

Company *

CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.

By: *

TONY STORELLI

Title *

CHIEF OPERATING OFFICER

Date *

7/11/2024

NOTE: The above certification is required by the Equal Employment Opportunity Regulations of the Secretary of Labor (41 CFR
60-1.7(b) (1), and must be submitted by bidders and proposed subcontractors only in connection with contracts and subcontracts
which are subject to the equal opportunity clause. Contracts and subcontracts which are exempt from the equal opportunity clause
are set forth in 41 CFR 60-1.5. (Generally only contracts or subcontracts of $10,000 or under are exempt.) Currently, Standard
Form 100 (EEO-1) is the only report required by the Executive Orders or their implementing regulations.

Currently, Standard Form 100 (EEO-1) is the only report required by the Executive Orders or their implementing regulations.

Proposed prime contractors and subcontractors who have participated in a previous contract or subcontract subject to the
Executive Orders and have not filed the required reports should note that 41 CFR 60-1.7(b) (1) prevents the award of contracts
and subcontracts unless such contractor submits a report covering the delinquent period or such other period specified by the
Director, Office of Federal Contract Compliance, U. S. Department of Labor.

Title 49, Code Of Federal Regulations, Part 29 - Debarment And Suspension Certification -
Proposal 10

The bidder or proposed subcontractor under penalty of perjury, certifies that, except as noted below, he/she or any person
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associated therewith in the capacity of owner, partner, director, officer, manager:

is not currently under suspension, debarment, voluntary exclusion, or determination of ineligibility by any federal agency;

has not been suspended, debarred, voluntarily excluded or determined ineligible by any federal agency within the past 3
years;

does not have a proposed debarment pending; and

has not been indicted, convicted, or had a civil judgment rendered against it by a court of competent jurisdiction in any
matter involving fraud or official misconduct within the past 3 years.

If no exceptions enter "No Exceptions." If there are any exceptions to this certification, insert the exceptions in the
following space: *

NO EXCEPTIONS

Exceptions will not necessarily result in denial of award, but will be considered in determining bidder responsibility.

For any exception noted above, indicate below to whom it applies, initiating agency, and dates of action:

N/A

Note: Providing false information may result in criminal prosecution or administrative sanctions.

The above certification is part of the Proposal. Signing the Proposal on the signature portion thereof shall also constitute
signature of this Certification.

By my signature on this proposal, I certify, under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California and the United States
of America, that the Title 23 United States Code, Section 112 Non-Collusion Declaration and the Title 49 Code of Federal
Regulations, Part 29 Debarment and Suspension Certification are true and correct.
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Company *

CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.

By *

TONY STORELLI

Date *

7/11/2024

Title *

CHIEF OPERATING OFFICER

Nonlobbying Certification For Federal-Aid Contracts - Proposal 11

The prospective participant certifies, by signing and submitting this bid or proposal, to the best of his or her knowledge and belief,
that:(1) No Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid, by or on behalf of the undersigned, to any person for
influencing or attempting to influence an officer or employee of any Federal agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or
employee of Congress, or an employee of a Member of Congress in connection with awarding of any cooperative agreement, and
the extension, continuation, renewal, amendment, or INSTALLATION of any Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative
agreement.

(2) If any funds other than Federal appropriated funds have been paid or will be paid to any person for influencing or attempting
to influence an officer of any Federal agency, a Member of Congress, an officer or employee of Congress, or an employee of a
Member of Congress in connection with this Federal contract, grant, loan, or cooperative agreement, the undersigned shall
complete and submit Standard Form-LLL, “Disclosure of Lobbying Activities,” in accordance with its instructions.

This certification is a material representation of fact upon which reliance was placed when this transaction was made or entered
into. Submission of this certification is a prerequisite for making or entering into this transaction imposed by Section 1352, Title
31, U.S. Code. Any person who fails to file the required certification shall be subject to a civil penalty of not less than $10,000
and not more than $100,000 for each such failure.

The prospective participant also agrees by submitting his or her bid or proposal that he or she shall require that the language of
this certification be included in all lower tier subcontracts, which exceed $100,000 and that all such subrecipients shall certify and
disclose accordingly.

Bidder *

CAL VALLEY CONSTRUCTION, INC.

By *

Tony Storelli
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Date *

7/11/2024

Title *

CHIEF OPERATING OFFICER

Disclosure of Lobbying, DBE Forms, and Bidders List of Subcontractors - Proposal 12-15

OMB 0348-0046 Disclosure of Lobbying Activities - Proposal 12 (223 KB)
Disclosure of Lobbying Activities

Exhibit 15G Constructions Contract DBE Commitment - Proposal 13 (2.76 MB)
LAPM Exhibit 15-G Construction Contract DBE Commitment
Form

Exhibit 15H Proposer Contractor Good Faith Efforts - Proposal 14 (730 KB)
LAPM Exhibit 15-H DBE Information - Good Faith Effort

Exhibit 12B Bidder's List of Subcontractors - Proposal 15 (564 KB)
LAPM Exhibit 12-B Bidder's List of Subcontractors

Proposal 16

NOT USED

Guaranty - Proposal 17

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

(This guaranty shall be executed by the successful bidder in accordance with instructions in the special provisions. The bidder
may execute the guaranty on this page at the time of submitting their bid.)

G U A R A N T Y

To the Owner: County of Fresno

CONTRACT NUMBER
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The undersigned guarantees the construction and installation of the following work included in this project: 24-07-C

ALL WORK

Should any of the materials or equipment prove defective or should the work as a whole prove defective, due to faulty
workmanship, material furnished or methods of installation, or should the work or any part thereof fail to operate properly as
originally intended and in accordance with the plans and specifications, due to any of the above causes, all within twelve (12)
months after date on which this contract is accepted by the Owner, the undersigned agrees to reimburse the Owner, upon
demand, for its expenses incurred in restoring said work to the condition contemplated in said project, including the cost of any
such equipment or materials replaced and the cost of removing and replacing any other work necessary to make such
replacement or repairs, or, upon demand by the Owner, to replace any such material and to repair said work completely without
cost to the Owner so that said work will function successfully as originally contemplated.

The Owner shall have the unqualified option to make any needed replacement or repairs itself or to have such replacements or
repairs done by the undersigned. In the event the Owner elects to have said work performed by the undersigned, the undersigned
agrees that the repairs shall be made and such materials as are necessary shall be furnished and installed within a reasonable
time after the receipt of demand from the Owner.

Date: *

No bid

Name (Printed): *

No bid

Signature: *

No bid

Title: *

No bid

Contractor: *

No bid

California Code of Regulations: General Requirements for In-Use Off-Road Diesel-Fueled
Fleets - Proposal 18

In conformance with Title 13 § 2449(i), bidders will be required to attach copies of valid Certificates of Reported Compliance for
the fleet selected for the contract and their listed subcontractors.

Before May 15th of each year, the prime contractor must collect a new valid Certificate of Reported Compliance for the current
compliance year, as defined in section 2449(n), from all fleets that have an ongoing contract with the prime contractor as of
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March 1 of that year. Prime contractors must not write contracts to evade this requirement. Annual renewals must be provided to
the Resident Engineer at least one week prior to the expiration date of the current certificate.

https://ww2.arb.ca.gov/resources/fact-sheets/fact-sheet-contracting-requirements

Choose all that apply:

✓✓Bidder’s Certificate of Reported Compliance has been attached to the bid.

Bidder does not have a fleet subject to this regulation as outlined in Section 2449(i)(1)-(4).

✓✓Listed subcontractors’ certificates have been attached or will be submitted within five (5) calendar days of the
bid opening.

✓✓The following subcontractors do not have a fleet subject to this regulation as outlined in Section 2449(i)(1)-(4):

AWP SAFETY
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FAILURE TO PROVIDE THE CERTIFICATES OF REPORTED COMPLIANCE AS DIRECTED MAY RENDER THE BID NON-
RESPONSIVE.

Required Documents

Name Omission Terms Submitted File

Exhibit 10Q Disclosure of Lobbying Activites -
Proposal 12
Complete this form to disclose lobbying activities
pursuant to 31 U.S.C. 1352

Submit disclosure if needed. Proposal_Disclosure_of_Lobbying_Activities.pdf

Exhibit 15-G Construction Contract DBE
Commitment - Proposal 13
Local Assistance Procedures Manual Exhibit
15-G Construction Contract DBE Commitment
Form

Due by 4pm on the 5th calendar day after bid
opening.

I am not enclosing this document
omission terms have been met.

Exhibit 15-H Proposer/Contractor Good Faith
Effort - Proposal 14
Local Assistance Procedures Manual Exhibit
15-H DBE Information - Good Faith Effort

If DBE Goal not met, submit with 15-G by 4pm
on the 5th calendar day after bid opening.

I am not enclosing this document
omission terms have been met.

Exihibt 12B Bidder's List of Subcontractors -
Proposal 15
Local Assistance Procedures Manual Exhibit
12-B Bidder's List of Subcontractors

Due by 4pm on the 5th calendar day after bid
opening unless no subcontractors are listed on
bid.

Proposal-15-12B-Bidders-List-of-
Subcontractors-Revised-2019-01.pdf

CARB Certification of Reported Compliance -
Bidder
Valid CARB Certification of Reported Compliance
- Bidder

Does not have a fleet subject to this regulation. CAL VALLEY.pdf

CARB Certification(s) of Reported Compliance -
Subcontractors
Valid CARB Certification(s) of Reported
Compliance - Subcontractors

Due by 4pm on the 5th calendar day after bid
opening or no listed subcontractors have a fleet
subject to this regulation.

SPM.pdf

6 Required Documents

Additional Documents (Use if needed)

Name Omission Terms
Submitted

File

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

3 Required Documents
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Name Omission Terms
Submitted

File

Not Required
Extra Space if needed

Extra space not needed No bid

Not Required
Extra Space if needed

Extra space not needed No bid

Not Required
Extra Space if needed

Extra space not needed No bid

3 Required Documents
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January	1,	2024

CAL	VALLEY	CONSTRUCTION,	INC.

2/28/2025

3680

http://www.arb.ca.gov/doors/compliance_cert1.html







January	1,	2024

MIDSTATE	BARRIER	INC.

2/28/2025

5447

http://www.arb.ca.gov/doors/compliance_cert1.html



 

 

Statewide Traffic Safety & Signs DBA Statewide Safety Systems 

2722 S Fairview St Santa Ana, CA 92704 / statewidess.com 

Arizona / California / Colorado / Hawaii / Nevada / New Mexico / Oregon / Texas / Utah / Washington 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 07/12/2024  
 
Cal Valley Construction  
 
 
Re: East Reedley Bridge Replacements 
CARB does not apply to Statewide Safety Systems  
We do not have off-road diesel fueled fleets.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Sincerely,  
Ross Elliott 
 
 
 
 
  

dperkins
Stamp



January 1, 2024

KROEKER, INC

2/28/2025

1243

http://www.arb.ca.gov/doors/compliance_cert1.html
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