

General Info

Alt Total: \$2,131,779.40

Total:

\$9,363,577.90

Number	Description
24-03-C	Elkhorn Recharge Facility
Deadline 10/08/2024 02:00 PM PDT	The work consists of, in general, of the construction of an approximately sixty-acre recharge basin and stockpile area at the site including basin excavation, compacted stockpile placement, placement of excess basin material, conveyance channel excavation, cast-in-place and precast concrete structures, furnishing and installing slides gates, propeller meters, rubber gasketed reinforced concrete pipe (RGRCP), County road crossing, and all other miscellaneous items to complete the work described in the Plans and Specifications to provide for a fully functioning recharge basin.
Vendor Granite Construction Company	
Submitted 10/08/2024 01:17 PM PDT	Allows zero unit prices and labor
Signed by Matthew Hall Account Holder Matthew Hall	Yes Allows negative unit prices and labor
Opened 10/08/2024 02:13 PM PDT By jwongsing@fresnocountyca.gov	Yes

Attachment List

Project Website
RFC form, bid opening details, any Supplemental Information
including RFC responses, prebid conference information, etc.

Plans (11 MB)
Plans (11 MB)

Specifications (11 MB)
Specifications (11 MB)

Proposal to the County of Fresno - Proposal 1

Proposal to the County of Fresno

hereinafter called the Owner

ELKHORN RECHARGE FACILITY
500 E. ELKHORN AVE.
CARUTHERS, CA 93609

The work embraced herein shall be done in accordance with the 2023 Standard Specifications and with the 2023 Standard Plans, of the State of California, Department of Transportation insofar as the same may apply and in accordance with these special provisions.

Except to the extent that they may conflict with these special provisions, revised Standard Specifications apply to the extent included in the section entitled "Project Details" of the book entitled "Specifications."

The work to be done is shown on a set of Plans, Department File No. 11330, entitled: "Elkhorn Recharge Facility".

The undersigned, as bidder, declares that the only persons, or parties interested in this proposal as principals are those named herein, that this proposal is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation; that they have carefully examined the location of the proposed work, the annexed proposed form of contract, and the plans therein referred to; and they propose and agree if this proposal is accepted, that they will contract with the Owner to provide all necessary machinery, tools, apparatus and other means of construction, and to do all the work and furnish all the materials specified in the contract in the manner and time therein prescribed, and according to the requirements of the Engineer as therein set forth, and that they will take in full payment therefor the following unit prices, to-wit:

Bid Item List - Proposal 2

\$7,231,798.50

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Item Description	Item Price	Extension
1	1	LS	Mobilization/Demobilization, Bonds, Insurance & Permits	\$930,000.00	\$930,000.00
2	1	LS	Job Site Management	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00
3	1	LS	Traffic Control	\$50,000.00	\$50,000.00
4	1	LS	Storm Water Pollution Prevention Plan (SWPPP) - Preparation and Implementation	\$3,800.00	\$3,800.00
5	1,500	\$	State Water Resources Control Board - Notice of Intent	\$1.00	\$1,500.00
6	1	LS	Dust Control Plan (DCP) - Preparation and Implementation	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00
7	25,000	\$	Supplemental Work Allowance	\$1.00	\$25,000.00
8	1	LS	Site Demolition at Well Sites	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00
9	800	LF	Remove and Dispose of Existing PVC Irrigation Pipe Sections	\$24.00	\$19,200.00
10	150	LF	Remove and Dispose of Existing Asbestos Cement Pipe Section	\$100.00	\$15,000.00
11	1	LS	Clearing and Grubbing of Vegetation	\$569,000.00	\$569,000.00
12	93,160	CY	Removal of Top Soil in Basin Area and Compacted Placement in Stockpile Areas	\$3.60	\$335,376.00
13	1	LS	Crush Demolished Soil Cement and Compacted Placement in Stockpile Areas	\$84,000.00	\$84,000.00
14	17,270	CY	Conveyance Channel Excavation and Compacted Placement in Stockpile Areas	\$7.00	\$120,890.00
15	11,440	CY	Basin Excavation and Compacted Placement on Basin Levee	\$8.20	\$93,808.00
16	519,810	CY	Basin Excavation and Compacted Placement in Stockpile Areas	\$6.00	\$3,118,860.00
17	1	LS	Construct Liberty Canal Turnout / Conveyance Channel Inlet Structure	\$770,000.00	\$770,000.00
18	1	LS	Construct Conveyance Channel Outlet / Basin Inlet Structure	\$750,000.00	\$750,000.00
19	8,207	LF	Furnish & Install Chain Link Fence	\$23.50	\$192,864.50
Total:					\$7,231,798.50

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Item Description	Item Price	Extension
20	1	EA	Furnish & Install Chain Link 24-foot Double Drive Gate	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00
21	1	EA	Convert Existing Central Well Site to a Monitoring Well	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00
22	1	EA	Convert Existing Northwest Well Site to a Monitoring Well	\$17,000.00	\$17,000.00
Total:					\$7,231,798.50

Additive 1

\$532,450.00

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Item Description	Item Price	Extension
Alternate: Owner-agency may award independently from entire bid.					
A11	1	LS	Additional Mobilization/Demobilization, Bonds, Insurance & Permits	\$34,000.00	\$34,000.00
A12	99,690	CY	Basin Excavation and Compacted Placement in Stockpile Area D1 (N-S)	\$5.00	\$498,450.00
				Alternate Total:	\$532,450.00
				Total:	\$532,450.00

Additive 2

\$579,125.00

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Item Description	Item Price	Extension
Alternate: Owner-agency may award independently from entire bid.					
A21	1	LS	Additional Mobilization/Demobilization, Bonds, Insurance & Permits	\$26,000.00	\$26,000.00
A22	93,750	CY	Basin Excavation and Compacted Placement in Stockpile Area D2 (E-W)	\$5.90	\$553,125.00
				Alternate Total:	\$579,125.00
				Total:	\$579,125.00

Additive 3

\$1,020,204.40

Item No.	Quantity	Unit	Item Description	Item Price	Extension
Alternate: Owner-agency may award independently from entire bid.					
A31	1	LS	Additional Mobilization/Demobilization, Bonds, Insurance & Permits	\$58,000.00	\$58,000.00
A32	201,720	CY	Basin Excavation to ultimate depth and Placement of Excess Basin Material	\$4.77	\$962,204.40
				Alternate Total:	\$1,020,204.40
				Total:	\$1,020,204.40

Evaluation of Bid Item List - Proposal 3

Abbreviations used in the bid proposal sheet are identified in Section 1-1.06, "Abbreviations," of these special provisions.

Bids are required for the entire work. Bids will be compared on the basis indicated in the Notice to Bidders. The bidder shall set forth for each unit basis item of work a unit price and a total for the item, and for each lump sum item a total for the item, all in clearly legible figures in the respective spaces provided for that purpose. In the case of unit basis items, the amount set forth under the "Item Total" column shall be the product of the unit price bid and the estimated quantity for the item.

In case of discrepancy between the unit price and the total set forth for a unit basis item, the unit price shall prevail, except as provided in (a) or (b), as follows:

(a) If the amount set forth as a unit price is unreadable or otherwise unclear, or is omitted, or is the same as the amount as the entry in the item total column, then the amount set forth in the item total column for the item shall prevail and shall be divided by the estimated quantity for the item and the price thus obtained shall be the unit price;

(b) (Decimal Errors) If the product of the entered unit price and the estimated quantity is exactly off by a factor of ten, one hundred, etc., or one-tenth, or one-hundredth, etc. from the entered total, the discrepancy will be resolved by using the entered unit price or item total, whichever most closely approximates percentage-wise the unit price or item total in the Owner's Final Estimate of cost.

If both the unit price and the item total are unreadable or otherwise unclear, or are omitted, the bid may be deemed irregular. Likewise, if the item total for a lump sum item is unreadable or otherwise unclear, or is omitted, the bid may be deemed irregular unless the project being bid has only a single item and a clear, readable total bid is provided.

Symbols such as commas and dollar signs will be ignored and have no mathematical significance in establishing any unit price or item total or lump sums. Written unit prices, item totals and lump sums will be interpreted according to the number of digits and, if applicable, decimal placement. Cents symbols also have no significance in establishing any unit price or item total since all figures are assumed to be expressed in dollars and/or decimal fractions of a dollar. Bids on lump sum items shall be item totals only; if any unit price for a lump sum item is included in a bid and it differs from the item total, the items total shall prevail.

The foregoing provisions for the resolution of specific irregularities cannot be so comprehensive as to cover every omission, inconsistency, error or other irregularity which may occur in a bid. Any situation not specifically provided for will be determined in the discretion of the Owner, and that discretion will be exercised in the manner deemed by the Owner to best protect the public interest in the prompt and economical completion of the work. The decision of the Owner respecting the amount of a bid, or the existence or treatment of an irregularity in a bid, shall be final.

If this proposal shall be accepted and the undersigned shall fail to contract, as aforesaid, and to give the two bonds in the sums to be determined as aforesaid, with surety satisfactory to the Owner, within eight (8) days not including Saturdays, Sundays and legal holidays, after the bidder has received notice of award of the contract, the Owner, at its option, may determine that the bidder has abandoned the contract, and thereupon this proposal and the acceptance thereof shall be null and void, and the forfeiture of such security accompanying this proposal shall operate and the same shall be the property of the Owner.

Bid Security - Proposal 4

Bond Percentage

10.00%

Guarantee Method *

Electronic Bid Bond

You must either attach an electronic bid bond here or provide an original bid bond (or other form of bid security authorized by Public Contract Code Section 20129(a)) to the office location according to the instructions in the Notice to Bidders **prior to** the bid opening.

Electronic Bid Bond

Bond ID *

SCA1002100534

Surety Agency *

Surety 2000

Verify Bid Bond *

Bid bond verification has been completed.

Surety State *

CT

Principal *

Granite Construction
Company

Addendum Acknowledgement - Proposal 4

Bidders must acknowledge all addenda. The Bidder acknowledges receipt of the following **ADDENDA**:

(Enter the number the Designer has assigned to each of the addenda that the Bidder is acknowledging)

Type N/A if no addenda were issued. Click "+" to add additional fields.

Addendum No. *

N/A

Dated *

N/A

Bidder Signature - Proposal 4

Business Name *

Granite Construction Company

Note: If bidder or other interested person is a corporation, state legal name of corporation. If bidder is a co-partnership, state true name of firm.

Type of Business *

Corporation - list Officers

Business Owners and Officers Names *

Kyle T. Larkin, President
James A. Radich, Vice President
M. Craig Hall, Secretary
Kim Craig, Treasurer
Jeffrey W. Grimm, Area Manager
Matt Hall, Chief Estimator

Note: If bidder or other interested person is:

- *a corporation, list names of the president, secretary, treasurer and manager thereof*
- *a partnership, list names of all individual co-partners composing firm.*
- *an individual, state first and last name in full.*

Names of Owners and Key Employees *

Kyle T. Larkin, President
James A. Radich, Vice President
M. Craig Hall, Secretary
Kim Craig, Treasurer
Jeffrey W. Grimm, Area Manager
Matt Hall, Chief Estimator

Note: List majority owners of your firm. If multiple owners, list all. Also include anyone, including key employees, who are actively promoting the contract. (SB1439)

Licensed in accordance with an act providing for the registration of Contractors:

Class *

A, B

Contractor License No. * Expires *

89 05/31/2025

DIR Registration Number *

1000000085

Business Address *

2716 Granite Court, Fresno, CA

Zip Code *

93706

Mailing Address *

2716 Granite Court, Fresno, CA

Zip Code *

93706

Business Phone *

(559) 441-5700

Fax Number

(559) 441-5791

E-mail Address *

matt.hall@gcinc.com

Signature of Bidder *

Matthew Hall

Dated *

10/08/2024

NOTE: If bidder is a corporation, the legal name of the corporation shall be set forth above together with the signature of the officer or officers authorized to sign contracts on behalf of the corporation; if bidder is a co-partnership, the true name of the firm shall be set forth above together with the signature of the partner or partners authorized to sign contracts on behalf of the co-partnership; and if bidder is an individual, bidder signature shall be placed above. If signature is by an agent, other than an officer of a corporation or a member of a partnership, a Power of Attorney must be on file with the Owner prior to opening bids or submitted with the bid; otherwise, the bid will be disregarded as irregular and unauthorized.

Noncollusion Declaration - Proposal 5

TO BE EXECUTED BY BIDDER AND SUBMITTED WITH BID*

The undersigned declares:

I am the (Choose one of the following options): *

Corporate Officer

If Corporate Officer please list Title:

Chief Estimator

of (Business Name): *

Granite Construction Company

the party making the foregoing bid.

The bid is not made in the interest of, or on behalf of, any undisclosed person, partnership, company, association, organization, or corporation. The bid is genuine and not collusive or sham. The bidder has not directly or indirectly induced or solicited any other bidder to put in a false or sham bid. The bidder has not directly or indirectly colluded, conspired, connived, or agreed with any bidder or anyone else to put in a sham bid, or refrain from bidding. The bidder has not in any manner, directly or indirectly, sought by agreement, communication, or conference with anyone to fix the bid price of the bidder or any other bidder, or to fix any overhead, profit, or cost element of the bid price, or of that of any other bidder. All statements contained in the bid are true. The bidder has not, directly or indirectly, submitted his or her bid price or any breakdown thereof, or the contents thereof, or divulged information or data relative thereto, to any corporation, partnership, company, association, organization, bid depository, or to any member or agent thereof, and has not paid, and will not pay, any person or entity for that purpose.

Any person executing this declaration on behalf of a bidder that is a corporation, partnership, joint venture, limited liability company, limited liability partnership, or any other entity, hereby represents that he or she has full power to execute, and does execute, this declaration on behalf of the bidder.

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing is true and correct and that this declaration is executed on _____, 2024,

Date: *

10/08/2024

at City, State: *

Fresno, CA

Signature: *

Matthew Hall

(See Title 23 United States Code Section 112; Calif Public Contract Code Section 7106)

*NOTE: Completing, signing, and returning the Non-Collusion Declaration is a required part of the Proposal. Bidders are cautioned that making a false certification may subject the certifier to criminal prosecution.

Public Contract Code - Proposal 6-7

Public Contract Code Section 10285.1 Statement - Proposal 6

In conformance with Public Contract Code Section 10285.1 (Chapter 376, Stats. 1985), the bidder hereby declares under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the bidder

Choose an option: *

Has not been convicted

within the preceding three years of any offenses referred to in that section, including any charge of fraud, bribery, collusion, conspiracy, or any other act in violation of any state or Federal antitrust law in connection with the bidding upon, award of, or performance of, any public works contract, as defined in Public Contract Code Section 1101, with any public entity, as defined in Public Contract Code Section 1100, including the Regents of the University of California or the Trustees of the California State University. The term "bidder" is understood to include any partner, member, officer, director, responsible managing officer, or responsible managing employee thereof, as referred to in Section 10285.1.

The above Statement is part of the Bid. Signing this Bid on the signature portion thereof shall also constitute signature of this Statement. Bidders are cautioned that making a false certification may subject the certifier to criminal prosecution.

Public Contract Code Section 10162 Questionnaire - Proposal 7

In conformance with Public Contract Code Section 10162, the Bidder shall complete, under penalty of perjury, the following questionnaire:

Has the bidder, any officer of the bidder, or any employee of the bidder who has a proprietary interest in the bidder, ever been disqualified, removed, or otherwise prevented from bidding on, or completing a federal, state, or local government project because of a violation of law or a safety regulation?

Choose an option: *

No

If the answer is No, please type N/A. If the answer is Yes, explain the circumstances in the following space. *

N/A

Public Contract Code Section 10232 Statement - Proposal 7

In conformance with Public Contract Code Section 10232, the Contractor hereby states under penalty of perjury, that no more than

one final unappealable finding of contempt of court by a federal court has been issued against the Contractor within the immediately preceding two-years period because of the Contractor's failure to comply with an order of the National Labor Relations Board.

Note: The above Statement and Questionnaire are part of the Bid. Signing this Bid on the signature portion thereof shall also constitute signature of this Statement and Questionnaire. Bidders are cautioned that making a false certification may subject the certifier to criminal prosecution.

Subcontractors - Proposal 8(a)

The following named subcontractor(s) will perform with labor, or otherwise render services to the general contractor in or about the construction of the work or improvement in an amount in excess of one-half of one percent of the total bid presented herewith. Each listed subcontractor's name, location of business and description of work, and both their contractor's license number and public works contractor registration number, issued pursuant to Section 1725.5 of the Labor Code, are REQUIRED, by Section 4104 of the California Public Contract Code, to be submitted prior to bid opening. (The "location of business" must specify the city in which the subcontractor's business is located, and the state if other than California.) All other requested information shall be submitted, either with the bid or within 24 hours after bid opening.

Please fill out as completely as possible when submitting your bid. Use subcontractor's business name style as registered with the License Board.

FAILURE TO LIST SUBCONTRACTORS AS DIRECTED MAY RENDER THE BID NON-RESPONSIVE, OR MAY RESULT IN ASSESSMENT OF A PENALTY AGAINST THE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 4110 OF THE CALIFORNIA PUBLIC CONTRACT CODE.

Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields.

Subcontractor: *

Golden Bay Fence plus Iron Works Inc.

Business Address *

4104 South B Street Stockton, CA 95206

Class

License No. *

664905

DIR Registration No. *

1000000720

Item No. or Description of Work *

Fencing

Dollar Amount:

OR

Percentage of Total Bid:

Email Address:

Subcontractors - Proposal 8(b)

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

The following named subcontractor(s) will perform with labor, or otherwise render services to the general contractor in or about the construction of the work or improvement in an amount in excess of one-half of one percent of the total bid presented herewith. Please fill out as completely as possible when submitting your bid. Use subcontractor's business name style as registered with the License Board. Submission of subcontractor's name, location of business and description of work, California contractor's license number and public works contractor registration number issued pursuant to Section 1725.5 of the Labor Code, all are REQUIRED, by Section 4104 of the California Public Contract Code, to be submitted prior to bid opening. (The "location of business" must specify the city in which the subcontractor's business is located, and the state if other than California.) All other requested information shall be submitted, either with the bid or within 24 hours after bid opening.

Please fill out as completely as possible when submitting your bid. Use subcontractor's business name style as registered with the License Board.

FAILURE TO LIST SUBCONTRACTORS AS DIRECTED MAY RENDER THE BID NON-RESPONSIVE. OR MAY RESULT IN ASSESSMENT OF A PENALTY AGAINST THE BIDDER IN ACCORDANCE WITH SECTION 4110 OF THE CALIFORNIA PUBLIC CONTRACT CODE.

Subcontractor: To add more subcontractor listings, click the "+" to add additional fields.

Subcontractor: *

No bid

Business Address *

No bid

Class

No bid

License No. *

No bid

DIR Registration No. *

No bid

Item No. or Description of Work *

No bid

Dollar Amount:

OR

Percentage of Total Bid:

No bid

No bid

Email Address:

No bid



California Code of Regulations: General Requirements for In-Use Off-Road Diesel-Fueled Fleets - Proposal 9

In conformance with Title 13 § 2449(i), bidders will be required to attach copies of valid Certificates of Reported Compliance for the fleet selected for the contract and their listed subcontractors.

Before May 15th of each year, the prime contractor must collect a new valid Certificate of Reported Compliance for the current compliance year, as defined in section 2449(n), from all fleets that have an ongoing contract with the prime contractor as of March 1 of that year. Prime contractors must not write contracts to evade this requirement. Annual renewals must be provided to the Resident Engineer at least one week prior to the expiration date of the current certificate.

<https://ww2.arb.ca.gov/resources/fact-sheets/fact-sheet-contracting-requirements>

Choose all that apply:

Bidder's Certificate of Reported Compliance has been attached to the bid.

Bidder does not have a fleet subject to this regulation as outlined in Section 2449(i)(1)-(4).

Listed subcontractors' certificates have been attached or will be submitted within five (5) calendar days of the bid opening.

The following subcontractors do not have a fleet subject to this regulation as outlined in Section 2449(i)(1)-(4):

Golden Bay Fence plus Iron Works Inc.

FAILURE TO PROVIDE THE CERTIFICATES OF REPORTED COMPLIANCE AS DIRECTED MAY RENDER THE BID NON-RESPONSIVE.

Proposal 10-18

NOT USED

Guaranty - Proposal 19

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

(This guaranty shall be executed by the successful bidder in accordance with instructions in the special provisions. The bidder may execute the guaranty on this page at the time of submitting their bid.)

G U A R A N T Y

To the Owner: County of Fresno

CONTRACT NUMBER

The undersigned guarantees the construction and installation of the following work included in this project: 24-03-C

ALL WORK

Should any of the materials or equipment prove defective or should the work as a whole prove defective, due to faulty workmanship, material furnished or methods of installation, or should the work or any part thereof fail to operate properly as originally intended and in accordance with the plans and specifications, due to any of the above causes, all within twelve (12) months after date on which this contract is accepted by the Owner, the undersigned agrees to reimburse the Owner, upon demand, for its expenses incurred in restoring said work to the condition contemplated in said project, including the cost of any such equipment or materials replaced and the cost of removing and replacing any other work necessary to make such replacement or repairs, or, upon demand by the Owner, to replace any such material and to repair said work completely without cost to the Owner so that said work will function successfully as originally contemplated.

The Owner shall have the unqualified option to make any needed replacement or repairs itself or to have such replacements or repairs done by the undersigned. In the event the Owner elects to have said work performed by the undersigned, the undersigned agrees that the repairs shall be made and such materials as are necessary shall be furnished and installed within a reasonable time after the receipt of demand from the Owner.

Date: *

No bid

Name (Printed): *

No bid

Signature: *

No bid

Title: *

No bid

Contractor: *

No bid

Required Documents

Name	Omission Terms	Submitted File
CARB Certification of Reported Compliance - Bidder Valid CARB Certification of Reported Compliance - Bidder	Does not have a fleet subject to this regulation.	CARB Cert.pdf
CARB Certification(s) of Reported Compliance - Subcontractors Valid CARB Certification(s) of Reported Compliance - Subcontractors	Due by 4pm on the 5th calendar day after bid opening or no listed subcontractors have a fleet subject to this regulation.	I am not enclosing this document because the omission terms have been met.
2 Required Documents		

Additional Documents (Use if needed)

Name	Omission Terms	Submitted File
Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.		
Not Required Extra Space if needed	Extra space not needed	No bid
Not Required Extra Space if needed	Extra space not needed	No bid
Not Required Extra Space if needed	Extra space not needed	No bid
3 Required Documents		

California Environmental Protection Agency
Air Resources Board

January 1, 2024

**CERTIFICATE OF REPORTED COMPLIANCE
OFF-ROAD DIESEL VEHICLE REGULATION**

is issued to

GRANITE CONSTRUCTION INC.

This certificate indicates that the fleet listed above has reported off-road diesel vehicles to the California Air Resources Board and has certified they are in compliance with title 13 CCR, section 2449. All applicable vehicles owned by the individual, company, or agency must be reported and labeled, as specified in Section 2449, with all possible completeness, else this certificate is null and void. **Certificate expires 2/28/2025**



Jack Kitowski
Chief, Mobile Source Control Division
California Air Resources Board

Off-road Diesel Fleet Identification

54

To verify the authenticity of this certificate, enter this number at
http://www.arb.ca.gov/doors/compliance_cert.html

California Environmental Protection Agency
Air Resources Board

January 1, 2024

**CERTIFICATE OF REPORTED COMPLIANCE
OFF-ROAD DIESEL VEHICLE REGULATION**

is issued to

GOLDEN BAY FENCE PLUS IRONWORKS

This certificate indicates that the fleet listed above has reported off-road diesel vehicles to the California Air Resources Board and has certified they are in compliance with title 13 CCR, section 2449. All applicable vehicles owned by the individual, company, or agency must be reported and labeled, as specified in Section 2449, with all possible completeness, else this certificate is null and void. **Certificate expires 2/28/2025**



Jack Kitowski
Chief, Mobile Source Control Division
California Air Resources Board

Off-road Diesel Fleet Identification

237923

To verify the authenticity of this certificate, enter this number at
http://www.arb.ca.gov/doors/compliance_cert1.html